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The Everyday and Everydayness * 

Before the series of revolutions which ushered in what is called the mod-
ern era, housing, modes of dress, eating and drinking-in short, living-
presented a prodigious diversity. Not subordinate to any one system, 
living varied according to region and country, levels and classes of the 
population, available natural resources, season, climate, profession, age, 
and sex. This diversity has never been well acknowledged or recognized 
as such; it has resisted a rational kind of interpretation which has only 
come about in our own time by interfering with and destroying that 
diversity. Today we see a worldwide tendency to uniformity. Rationality 
dominates, accompanied but not diversified by irrationality; signs, ra-
tional in their way, are attached to things in order to convey the prestige 
of their possessors and their place in the hierarchy. 

FORMS, FUNCTIONS AND STRUCTURES 

What has happened? There were, and there always have been forms, 
functions and structures. Things as well as institutions, "objects" as well 
as "subjects" offered up to the senses accessible and recognizable forms. 
People, whether individually or in groups, performed various functions, 
some of them physiological (eating, drinking, sleeping), others social 
(working, travelling). Structures, some of them natural and others con-
structed, allowed for the public or private performance of these functions, 
but with a radical-a root-difference: those forms, functions and struc-
tures were not known as such, not named. At once connected and dis-
tinct, they were part of an undifferentiated whole. Post-Cartesian analyt-
ic thought has often challenged these concrete "totalities": every analy-
sis of objective or social reality has come up with some residue resisting 

Translation of Henri Lefebvre, "Quotidien et QuotidiennetC," Encyclopaedia Uni-
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analysis, and the sum of such realities as seemed irreducible by human 
thought became a matter for infinite analysis, a reserve of divine thought. 
Every complex "whole," from the smallest tool to the greatest works of 
art and learning, therefore possessed a symbolic value linking them to 
meaning at its most vast: to divinity and humanity, power and wisdom, 
good and evil, happiness and misery, the perennial and the ephemeral. 
These immense values were themselves mutable according to historical 
circumstance, to social classes, to rulers and mentors. Each object (an 
armchair just as much as a piece of clothing, a kitchen utensil as much as 
a house) was thus linked to some "style" and therefore, as a work, con- 
tained while masking the larger functions and structures which were 
integral parts of its form. 

What happened to change the situation? The functional element was 
itself disengaged, rationalized, then industrially produced, and finally 
imposed by constraint and persuasion: that is to say, by means of adver- 
tising and by powerful economic and political lobbies. The relationship 
of form to function to structure has not disappeared. On the contrary, it 
has become a declared relationship, produced as such, more and more 
visible and readable, announced and displayed in a transparency of the 
three terms. A modern object clearly states what it is, its role and its 
place. This does not prevent its overstating or reproducing the signs of its 
meaningfulness: signs of satisfaction, of happiness, of quality, of wealth. 
From the modem armchair or coffee grinder to the automobile, the form- 
function-structure triumvirate is at once evident and legible. 

Within these parameters, there come to be constructed multiple 
systems or subsystems, each establishing in its own way a more or less 
coherent set of more or less durable objects. For example, in the domain of 
architecture, a variety of local, regional, and national architectural styles 
has given way to "architectural urbanism," a universalizing system of 
structures and functions in supposedly rational geometric forms. The 
same thing is true of industrially produced food: a system groups prod- 
ucts around various functionally specific household appliances such as 
the refrigerator, freezer, electric oven, etc. And of course the totalizing 
system that has been constructed around the automobile seems ready to 
sacrifice all of society to its dominion. It so happens that these systems 
and subsystems tend to deteriorate or blow out. Are even the days of car 
travel numbered? 

Whatever the case may be, housing, fashion and food have tended 
and still tend to constitute autonomous subsystems, closed off from one 
another. Each of them appears to present as great a diversity as the old 
modes of living of the premodern era. This diversity is only apparent. It is 
only arranged. Once the dominant forces making it possible for these 
elements to combine with one another is understood, the artificial mech- 
anism of their grouping is recognized and the fatuousness of their diver- 
sity becomes intolerable. The system breaks down. 
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All such systems have in common a general law of functionalism. 
The everyday can therefore be defined as a set of functions which connect 
and join together systems that might appear to be distinct. Thus defined, 
the everyday is a product, the most general of products in an era where 
production engenders consumption, and where consumption is manipu- 
lated by producers: not by "workers," but by the managers and owners of 
the means of production (intellectual, instrumental, scientific). The 
everyday is therefore the most universal and the most unique condition, 
the most social and the most individuated, the most obvious and the best 
hidden. A condition stipulated for the legibility of forms, ordained by 
means of functions, inscribed within structures, the everyday constitutes 
the platform upon which the bureaucratic society of controlled con- 
sumerism is erected. 

A COMMON DENOMINATOR 

The everyday is therefore a concept. In order for it to have ever been 
engaged as a concept, the reality it designated had to have become domi- 
nant, and the old obsessions about shortages-"Give us this day our daily 
bread . . ."-had to disappear. Until recently, things, furniture and build- 
ings were built one by one, and each existed in relation to accepted moral 
and social references, to symbols. From the twentieth century onward, all 
these references collapse, including the greatest and oldest figure of them 
all, that of the Father (eternal or temporal, divine or human). How can we 
grasp this extraordinary and still so poorly understood configuration of 
facts? The collapse of the referent in morality, history, nature, religion, 
cities, space; the collapse even of perspective in its classical spatial sense 
or the collapse of tonality in music. . . . Abundance-a rational, pro- 
grammed abundance and planned obsolescence-replacing shortage in 
the first world; destructive colonization of the third world and finally of 
nature itself. . . .The prevalence of signs; omnipresent war and violence; 
revolutions which follow one after another only to be cut short or to turn 
back against themselves . . . . 

The everyday, established and consolidated, remains a sole surviving 
common sense referent and point of reference. "Intellectuals," on the 
other hand, seek their systems of reference elsewhere: in language and 
discourse, or sometimes in a political party. The proposition here is to 
decode the modem world, that bloody riddle, according to the everyday. 

The concept of everydayness does not therefore designate a system, 
but rather a denominator common to existing systems including judicial, 
contractual, pedagogical, fiscal, and police systems. Banality? Why 
should the study of the banal itself be banal? Are not the surreal, the 
extraordinary, the surprising, even the magical, also part of the real? Why 
wouldn't the concept of everydayness reveal the extraordinary in the 
ordinary? 
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REPETITION AND CHANGE 

Thus formulated, the concept of the everyday illuminates the past. 
Everyday life has always existed, even if in ways vastly different from our 
own. The character of the everyday has always been repetitive and veiled 
by obsession and fear. In the study of the everyday we discover the great 
problem of repetition, one of the most difficult problems facing us. The 
everyday is situated at the intersection of two modes of repetition: the 
cyclical, which dominates in nature, and the linear, which dominates in 
processes known as "rational." The everyday implies on the one hand 
cycles, nights and days, seasons and harvests, activity and rest, hunger 
and satisfaction, desire and its fulfillment, life and death, and it implies 
on the other hand the repetitive gestures of work and consumption. 

In modern life, the repetitive gestures tend to mask and to crush the 
cycles. The everyday imposes its monotony. It is the invariable constant 
of the variations it envelops. The days follow one after another and re- 
semble one another, and yet-here lies the contradiction at the heart of 
everydayness-everything changes. But the change is programmed: ob- 
solescence is planned. Production anticipates reproduction; production 
produces change in such a way as to superimpose the impression of speed 
onto that of monotony. Some people cry out against the acceleration of 
time, others cry out against stagnation. They're both right. 

GENERAL AND DIVERSIFIED PASSIVITY 

Common denominator of activities, locus and milieu of human func- 
tions, the everyday can also be analysed as the uniform aspect of the 
major sectors of social life: work, family, private life, leisure. These sec- 
tors, though distinct as forms, are imposed upon in their practice by a 
structure allowing us to discover what they share: organized passivity. 
This means, in leisure activities, the passivity of the spectator faced with 
images and landscapes; in the workplace, it means passivity when faced 
with decisions in which the worker takes no part; in private life, it means 
the imposition of consumption, since the available choices are directed 
and the needs of the consumer created by advertising and market studies. 
This generalized passivity is moreover distributed unequally. It weighs 
more heavily on women, who are sentenced to everyday life, on the 
working class, on employees who are not technocrats, on youth-in 
short on the majority of people-yet never in the same way, at the same 
time, never all at once. 

MODERNITY 

The everyday is covered by a surface: that of modernity. News stories and 
the turbulent affectations of art, fashion and event veil without ever 
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eradicating the everyday blahs. Images, the cinema and television divert 
the everyday by at times offering up to it its own spectacle, or sometimes 
the spectacle of the distinctly noneverydayi violence, death, catastrophe, 
the lives of kings and stars-those who we are led to believe defy every- 
dayness. Modernity and everydayness constitute a deep structure that a 
critical analysis can work to uncover. 

Such a critical analysis of the everyday has itself been articulated in 
several conflicting ways. Some treat the everyday with impatiencei they 
want to "change life" and do it quicklyi they want it all and they want it 
now! Others believe that lived experience is neither important nor in- 
teresting, and that instead of trying to understand it, it should be mini- 
mized, bracketed, to make way for science, technology, economic 
growth, etc. 

To the former, we might reply that transforming the everyday re- 
quires certain conditions. A break with the everyday by means of fes- 
tival-violent or peaceful-cannot endure. In order to change life, soci- 
ety, space, architecture, even the city must change. To the latter, we 
might reply that it is monstrous to reduce "lived experience," that a 
recognition of the inadequacy of pious humanism does not authorize the 
assimilation of people to insects. Given the colossal technical means at 
our disposal and the terrifying dangers which lie in wait for us, we would 
risk, in that case, abandoning humanism only to enter into "superhu- 
manism." 

Translated by Christine Levich 
with the Editors 




